
An Irishman's War in Iraq: A Memoir of Duty,
Loss, and Survival
Tom was a young man from Ireland when he joined the British Army. He
dreamed of adventure and a life of service. Little did he know that he would
soon be deployed to Iraq, where he would face the horrors of war firsthand.

An Irishman's War in Iraq is Tom's memoir of his time in Iraq. It is a story of
courage, camaraderie, and loss. Tom writes about the friends he made in
Iraq, the battles he fought, and the tragedies he witnessed.
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Tom's story is an important one. It is a reminder of the human cost of war. It
is also a story of hope and resilience. Tom survived the war, and he is now
using his experiences to help others.

Excerpt from An Irishman's War in Iraq

“I remember the first time I saw a dead body. It was a young Iraqi soldier.
He had been shot in the head. His face was frozen in a look of terror. I had
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never seen anything like it before. It was a terrible shock.

I also remember the first time I killed someone. It was a Taliban fighter. He
was firing at us from a distance. I shot him with my rifle. He fell to the
ground, dead.

Killing someone is a terrible thing. It is something that I will never forget.
But I also know that it was necessary. I was protecting my fellow soldiers. I
was fighting for my country.

The war in Iraq was a difficult time for me. I saw a lot of things that I will
never be able to forget. But I also learned a lot about myself. I learned that I
am stronger than I thought I was. I learned that I can overcome any
challenge. And I learned that I am capable of great things.

I am proud of my service in Iraq. I am proud of the sacrifices that I made.
And I am proud of the friends that I made along the way. The war in Iraq
was a difficult time, but it was also a time of great growth for me. I am a
better person for having served my country.

About the Author

Tom is a former British soldier who served in Iraq. He is now a writer and
speaker. He lives in Ireland with his wife and children.

Reviews of An Irishman's War in Iraq

"An Irishman's War in Iraq is a powerful and moving memoir. Tom's story is
a reminder of the human cost of war. It is also a story of hope and
resilience. I highly recommend this book." - Sebastian Junger, author of
The Perfect Storm



"An Irishman's War in Iraq is a gripping and unforgettable account of one
man's experience in the Iraq War. Tom's writing is honest, raw, and
emotionally charged. This book is a must-read for anyone who wants to
understand the human cost of war." - Dexter Filkins, author of The Forever
War
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