
Delius and His Music: The Essential Guide to
a Great Composer
Frederick Delius (1862-1934) was one of the most important and influential
composers of the late Romantic and early modern eras. His music is known
for its lush harmonies, evocative melodies, and evocative orchestration,
and he is often considered one of the greatest English composers of all
time.

In his book Delius and His Music, Paul Guinery provides a comprehensive
and insightful look at the life and work of this remarkable composer.
Guinery traces Delius's journey from his early years in Bradford, England,
to his studies in Leipzig and Paris, and his eventual success as a composer
in England and America.
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Guinery's book is not only a biography, but also a critical analysis of
Delius's music. He examines Delius's compositional style, his use of
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harmony and melody, and his orchestration. He also discusses the
influence of other composers on Delius, and the impact of Delius's music
on later generations of composers.

Delius and His Music is an essential resource for anyone interested in the
life and work of Frederick Delius. Guinery's writing is clear and engaging,
and he provides a wealth of information and insights into Delius's music.

Frederick Delius: A Life in Music

Frederick Delius was born in Bradford, England, on January 29, 1862. He
was the son of a wealthy wool merchant, and he received a privileged
upbringing. Delius began studying music at an early age, and he showed a
great talent for composition. However, his father discouraged him from
pursuing a career in music, and he instead went to work in the family
business.

In 1884, Delius left England to study music in Leipzig. He studied
composition with Carl Reinecke and orchestration with Salomon
Jadassohn. Delius also met Edvard Grieg in Leipzig, and the two
composers became close friends. In 1888, Delius moved to Paris to
continue his studies. He studied composition with Léo Delibes and
orchestration with Vincent d'Indy. Delius also met Claude Debussy in Paris,
and the two composers became lifelong friends.

In 1897, Delius returned to England and settled in Gloucestershire. He
began to compose prolifically, and he soon gained a reputation as one of
the most important composers of his generation. Delius's music was often
performed in England and America, and he received commissions from
some of the world's leading orchestras.



In 1929, Delius was diagnosed with syphilis. The disease gradually
paralyzed him, and he was unable to compose for the last few years of his
life. Delius died in Grez-sur-Loing, France, on June 10, 1934.

Delius's Music

Delius's music is known for its lush harmonies, evocative melodies, and
evocative orchestration. He was influenced by a wide range of composers,
including Wagner, Grieg, and Debussy. However, Delius's music is unique,
and it has a distinctive sound that is immediately recognizable.

Delius's most famous works include the operas A Village Romeo and Juliet
and Koanga, the orchestral works Brigg Fair and On Hearing the First
Cuckoo in Spring, and the choral work A Mass of Life.

Delius's music is often described as "impressionistic." This is because it is
often evocative of nature and the emotions. Delius's music is also known
for its use of modal harmonies and pentatonic scales. These elements give
his music a unique and distinctive sound.

Delius's Legacy

Frederick Delius is considered one of the greatest English composers of all
time. His music is performed and recorded regularly, and it continues to
inspire and move listeners around the world.

Delius's legacy is not only his music, but also his influence on later
generations of composers. Composers such as Vaughan Williams, Holst,
and Britten were all influenced by Delius's music. Delius's music also had a
significant impact on American composers such as Aaron Copland and
Leonard Bernstein.



Frederick Delius was a true visionary, and his music continues to be a
source of inspiration and joy for listeners around the world.

Delius and His Music by Paul Guinery is the essential guide to the life and
work of this great composer. Guinery's writing is clear and engaging, and
he provides a wealth of information and insights into Delius's music. If you
are interested in learning more about Frederick Delius and his music, then
this book is a must-read.

Buy Delius and His Music on Our Book Library
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